
Headline 
Author Lor E. Lynn’s new book “Raven's Choice” is a meticulously crafted period romance with 
vivid characters and brilliant imagery sure to sing to the heart’s desires.   
 

Short Description 

Recent release “Raven's Choice” from Page Publishing author Lor E. Lynn is a 
marvelous tale of an English aristocrat and his horse, and how both fall in love with an 
angel with strawberry blonde hair and amethyst eyes.  
 

Long Description 

Lor E. Lynn, a lover of travel, music, and community, has completed her new book 
“Raven's Choice”:  a delightful and thrilling story of romance and a black stallion with a 
mind all his own. 
 

Published by New York City-based Page Publishing, Lor E. Lynn’s elegant tale begins 
with James Stuart Donovan Hastings, Earl of Billingswood, who has had one headache 
after another. First his home is in disrepair, his nephew is too young for his own good, 
his best friend thinks he’s gone round the bend, and now someone just tried to kill him. 
If it wasn’t for the angel with strawberry blonde hair and amethyst eyes, he might well be 
dead. Blasted horse, thinks he knows more than the master! 
 
Sweet Annabelle has been in hiding from both her brother and the man he was forced 
into choosing as her fiancé. It was going so well until she happened upon a rider-less 
black stallion. It was love at first sight for both Annabelle and the magnificent beast, but 
falling in love with his master was an entirely different matter. Now she’s trying to let 
them both go and escape those who would break her spirit. 
 
Now James must race to save the woman he has come to love from an overprotective 
brother, the reprobate knight, and his own vengeful past lover. All this to find the right 
time to tell her of his true feelings, and to make her his bride.  
 

Readers who wish to experience this gorgeous work can purchase “Raven's Choice” at 
bookstores everywhere, or online at the Apple iTunes store, Amazon, Google Play or 
Barnes and Noble. 
 

For additional information or media inquiries, contact Page Publishing at 866-315-2708. 
 

About Page Publishing:   
 

Page Publishing is a traditional New York based full-service publishing house that 
handles all of the intricacies involved in publishing its authors’ books, including 
distribution in the world’s largest retail outlets and royalty generation. Page Publishing 
knows that authors need to be free to create - not bogged down with complicated 
business issues like eBook conversion, establishing wholesale accounts, insurance, 
shipping, taxes and the like. Its roster of authors can leave behind these tedious, 
complex and time consuming issues, and focus on their passion: writing and creating. 
Learn more at www.pagepublishing.com. 


